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August 20, 2020 by Steve Freed 
Soybeans, soyoil, soymeal and corn futures traded lower. Wheat traded higher. US Dollar 
was lower. Crude was lower. Gold was lower. US Fed comments that Covid could pose a risk 
to US economic outlook weighed on commodity prices. 
 
SOYBEANS 
Soybean prices traded lower. Some link this to an improved US weather forecast and talk of 
higher US 2020 supply. Nov futures are back testing 9.00. USDA estimates that is 2020 
World soybean crop will increase 33 mmt. US is up 22 mmt, Brazil 8 mmt and Argentina 4 
mmt. There are also some that feel their demand outlook could also be high especially their 
estimate of US soybean exports. There is also talk that fact that Brazil farmers are getting 
record local currency for their soybean they could increase 2021 acres by 4 pct. Weather 
maps hint that late next week 65 pct of the Midwest could see .75-2.50 inches of rain. China  
announced that will begin US trade talks soon. Their appetite for energy, soybeans, wheat 
and corn suggest Covid is behind them and their economy is growing. Weekly US soybean 
old crop export sales were -.5 mil bu. Total commit is near 1,745 mil bu versus 1,786 last 
year. USDA goal is 1,650 versus 1,752 last year. New crop sales were 94 mil bu with total 
sales near 755 mil bu. USDA estimates US 2020/21 export near 2,125. Some feel that may 
be high. 
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CORN 
Corn futures traded lower but off session lows. Early weakness was linked to feelings that 
US corn yield may not drop as much as feared. Forecast of needed rains across the US 
Midwest late next week also offered resistance. Rumors of China interest in US corn may 
have offered support into the close. Pro Farmer tour participant estimated IL 2020 corn 
yield near 189.4 versus their estimate last year of 171.1 and USDA August guess of 207.0. 
Pro Farmer tour participant estimated W IA 2020 corn yield near from 172.4 to 184.7 
versus their estimate last year of 184.9 to 192.7 and USDA August guess of 202.0. 
Participants reported that the crops need a good rain to achieve these yields. Today,  
the tour will travel through the rest of IA and MN. The tour ends today and will report a US 
2020 corn yield tonight at 8.00. Pro Farmer will release a corn yield tomorrow at 1:30 
based on moisture conditions, crop maturity and will include estimate that also includes 
states outside the main US corn belt. Weekly US corn old crop export sales were 2 mil bu. 
Total commit is near 1,741 mil bu versus 1,972 last year. USDA goal is 1,795 versus 2,066 
last year. New crop sales were 28 mil bu with total sales near 480 mil bu. USDA estimates 
US 2020/21 export near 2,225. Some feel that may be high. USDA estimates World 2020 
corn production to increase 60 mmt with US up 43 and Brazil up 8 mmt. Some feel next  
weeks US corn crop rating will drop another 1-2 pct.  
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WHEAT 
Wheat futures traded higher. WZ has found support again near 5.00. Open interest is going 
up but trade volume is low. WZ moved above the 20,50 and 100 day moving average over 
the last few days. Fact China is buying US wheat and more rumors today of new buying  
helped futures. There is talk that China is in the marker buying futures on the close over the 
last few days. There are signs that China Covid is behind them and their economy may be 
improving. Besides wheat, China is buying energy, soybeans and corn. China reports both 
hog and poultry number are increasing. China has been selling corn, wheat and rice from 
reserves for feed. Weekly US wheat old crop export sales were 19 mil bu. Total commit is 
near 408 mil bu versus 383 last year. USDA goal is 975 versus 965 last year. USDA 
estimates World 2020 wheat production to drop 2 mmt. Lower EU crop cannot be totally  
offset by higher Canada, China, India, Australia and Russia. Some feel USDA could increase 
the crop size in coming reports.  

 
 
                           

 
 

http://www.admis.com/contact/account-forms

